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Emmanuel Macron presented his road map for ecology. The Head of State signed a column in Le 
Monde where he discusses ways to fight global warming. The objective is to reduce our carbon 
dioxide emissions, aiming for carbon neutrality by 2050 and save our biodiversity while fighting 
poverty and inequalities. Emmanuel Macron recalls that France must, like all G7 countries, do 
without coal by 2030. 
 
And in a week Emmanuel Macron will chair a national tribute ceremony to Jacques Delors. The 
former Minister of the Economy under François Mitterrand died Wednesday at the age of 98. 
The president paid tribute to an “inexhaustible architect of our Europe” and a “statesman with a 
French destiny”. The ceremony will take place next Friday, late morning at Les Invalides. 
 
And 90,000 police officers and gendarmes will be deployed in France for New Year's Eve, 
including 6,000 in Paris. Between 1 and 1.5 million visitors are expected on the Champs-Elysées 
on Sunday evening. The Minister of The Interior promises a great presence and great firmness in 
a context of a very high terrorist threat. 
 
Another site of the Secours Populaire was burglarized. After that of Echirolles, it is that of Saint-
André-de-la-Roche, near Nice, that was targeted a few days ago. Nearly 10,000 euros worth of 
equipment was stolen, especially computer equipment. 
 
And at least 16 deaths in Ukraine, after large-scale Russian attacks on Kyiv, Lviv and Odessa. 
Ukrainian authorities are asking the international community for additional resources. In France, 
Foreign Minister Catherine Colonna condemns this Friday the "strategy of terror" carried out by 
Russia and assures that France will continue to support Ukraine and provide it with the help it 
needs. 
 
And then it's been 10 years to the day since Michael Schumacher was the victim of his serious ski 
accident. On December 29, 2013, he suffered a serious head trauma in the Méribel resort. Since 
then, he has lived in his family home in Switzerland. His state of health remains very unclear. 
Michael Schumacher and Lewis Hamilton are still to this day the most successful drivers in 
Formula 1 with seven titles. 


